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Pricing Comparison

DS Services of

Blue Triton Brands

America Inc
B200106DWJ B240103CFC
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
, $4.50 $5.69
2.1.1. |Spring Water - 5 Gallon Bottle Each
. $4.29 $5.69
2.1.2. |Spring Water - 3 Gallon Bottle Each
, $5.75 $5.59
2.1.3. |Spring Water - 16.9 oz Bottles Case
$4.29 $5.39
2.2.1. [Purified Water - 5 Gallon Bottle Each
$4.29 No Bid
2.2.2. |Purified Water - 3 Gallon Bottle Each
$5.75 $5.39
2.2.3. [Purified Water - 16.9 oz Bottles Case
$4.29 $5.69
2.3.1. |Distilled Water - 5 Gallon Bottle Each
. $2.49 $2.99
3.1.1. |Water Dispensers Monthly Rental - Hot & Cold Each
Tabletop Water Dispenser Monthly Rental - Hot & $2.49 28.99
4.1.1. |Cold Each
$15.00 14.99
4.1.2. |Hand Pump Dispenser Single Purchase Each
No Bid
4.1.3. |Hand Pump Dispenser Monthly Rental Each
Drinking Cup Dispenser - 4 to 10 oz cone or flat No Bid
4.1.4. |bottom cups Each
39.99
4.1.5. [Storage Rack for Bottles Each
Disposable Cone Drinking Cups - 4 to 10 oz (max $3.65 399
4.1.6 [200 per pack) Pack
Disposable Flat Bottom Drinking Cups - 4 to 10 oz $3.19 2.99
4.1.7. |(max 200 per pack) Pack
Bottom Loading Water Dispensers Monthly Rental $2.49 6.99
4.1.8. |- Hot & Cold Each
$6.00 No Bid
5.1.1. |Bottle Replacement Fee Each
No Bid
5.1.2. [Water Dispenser Replacement Fee Each
No Bid
5.1.3. |Tabletop Dispenser Replacement Fee Each
14.99
5.1.4. [Hand Pump Dispenser Replacement Fee Each
No Bid
5.1.5. |Drinking Cup Dispenser Replacement Fee Each
39.99
5.1.6. |Storage Rack Replacement Fee Each




